

Trial 1 Result: 3 -1-5 Time: 30.12 Distance: 3.5, 3.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
1	1	Bogger Toby	4.57	Bmpru Blk 1		750	Y
2	3	Puckane Control	4.53	Bmpru Finwl	1500	650	N
3	5	Crickleowl Rose	4.5	Bmpru Blk 1		450	Y

Trial 2 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 30.08 Distance: 8.5, 1

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
4	2	Bogger Zoe	4.82	Stbtps Rnon	1200	350	n
5	4	Wilsham John	4.45	Faw ald		1000	y
6	6	Crickleowl Jill	4.53	Slaw Stb 2		500	y

Trial 3 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 30.28 Distance:0.5, 1.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
7	1	Gymstar Tornado	4.54	Blklru Finwl		1250	y
8	3	Tierneys Spark	4.57	Crd 1/2 Rnon	600	150	n
9	5	Kilcash Pa	4.39	Faw Evch		400	y

Trial 4 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.61 Distance: 10.5, 15

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
10	2	Spartazoom	4.31	Qaw Ald		2700	y
11	4	Lisdaleen Hawkeye	4.56	Slaw Rnon	700	250	n
12	6	Under The Stars	4.46	Evaw Crmpri		no bid	n

Trial 5 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.95 Distance: 0.75, Dist

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
13	5	Sober News	4.6	Slaw Finwl		850	y
14	3	Erril Bottle	4.45	Evaw Finwl		550	y
15	1	Efferogue Blake	4.48	Ck 2 Fd		w/d	n

Trial 6 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.47 Distance: 11.5, 5.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
16	6	Templetuothy King	4.52	Bmpru Finwl		2300	y
17	4	Lemon Bert	4.54	Bmpru Rnon		750	y
18	2	Dance Rocky	4.65	Msdwbk Rnon		no bid	n

Trial 7 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.29 Distance: 13, 12.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
19	1	Bobsleigh Tina	4.48	Impru Crd 1/2		550	y
21	5	Clandonagh	4.45	Evaw Finwl		2600	y
22	3	Master Blake	4.47	Bmpru Crd 1/2		no bid	n

Trial 8 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.66 Distance: 1.5, 8

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
-----	------	------	-------	---------	---------	-----	------

23	2	Lacken Bidy	4.33	Qaw Hdnrl	750	y
24	4	Sober Gem	4.52	Bmp 1 Bmp 2	wd	n
25	6	Curraghmore Kit	4.6	Bmp 1 Finwl	1600	y

Trial 9 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.56 Distance: 3, 4

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
26	1	Fearmore Aidan	4.6	Slaw Finwl		1050	y
27	3	Monroe Shadow	4.41	Chl 3/4 Rnon		350	y
28	5	Private Owner	4.46	Ahandy Crd 3/4		800	y

Trial 10 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 30.27 Distance: 1, 0.75

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
30	6	Fearmore Rosie	4.46	Ahandy Bmp 3		550	y
31	2	Arrigle Bally	4.46	Ahandy Bmp 3		450	y
32	4	Kilcash Timmy	4.45	Crd 3/4 finwl		275	y

Trial 11 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.25 Distance: 18, 2.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
33	5	Geneva Teejay	4.45	Ald Styo		2850	y
34	1	Master Bob	4.52	Slaw Crd 1/2		no bid	n
35	3	Ballintee Katie	4.55	Slaw Crd 1/2		w/d	n

Trial 12 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.50 Distance: 9.5, 6

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
36	2	Mikeys Double	4.37	Faw ald		1400	y
37	6	Eske Yassoo	4.57	Slaw Crd 1		no bid	n
38	4	No False Alarm	4.53	Slaw Crd 1		400	y

Trial 13 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.55 Distance: 2.5, 2

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
39	5	Ferndale Limo	4.44	Evaw Rnon		800	y
40	1	Mister Eventful	4.34	Faw ald		750	y
41	3	Coris Dream	4.46	Evaw Rnon	800	200	n

Trial 14 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.28 Distance: 8, 1.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
42	4	Airmount blitz	4.36	Faw ald		1650	y
43	6	Laganore Wild	4.44	Evaw Rnon	2000	750	n
44	2	Triangle Bilko	4.47	Evaw Rnon		800	y

Trial 15: Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.53 Distance: 8, 5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
45	1	Laganore Lar	4.52	Bmpru Finwl		950	y
46	5	Dricos Choice	4.47	Evaw Bmp 1		175	y
48	3	Coolbawn Swift	4.56	Bmpru Bmp 1		no bid	n

Trial 16: Result: 4-2-6 Time: 16.71

Distance: 8.5, 0.5

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
47	2	Barnacrow Diver		Evaw Bmp 2		no bid	n
49	4	Monroe Sky		Qaw ald		no bid	n
50	6	Barnacrow Brae		Evaw Bmp 2	400	150	n