

**Trial 1 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 30.23 Distance: 5, nk**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	1	1 Dance Lassie		4.49 Evaw Finwl	1200	650	N
	3	3 Roisins News		4.53 Evaw Blk 1	1000	650	n
	4	5 Monfin Rose		4.47 Evaw Blk 1			0 W/D

**Trial 2 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.96 Distance: 2.5, 2.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	5	2 Raven Maeve		4.62 Slaw Finwl			700 w/d
	7	6 Dalcash Fanatic		4.36 Faw ald		1500	y
	9	4 Vigorous Toby		4.45 Evaw Rnon	2200	1600	n

**Trial 3 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.77 Distance: 2.5, 3/4**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	8	1 Zacs Bigman		4.53 Bmp 1 Finwl			w/d
	10	5 Neigham King		4.42 Bmp 1 Finwl		1000	y
	11	3 Vigorous Vincent		4.43 Evaw Finwl	2200	1100	n

**Trial 4 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 30.36 Distance: 11.5, 4**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	12	2 Guard of Honour		4.48 Crd 1 Finwl			950 Y
	13	4 Sassy Sam		4.56 Crd 2 Bmp 3			600 Y
	14	6 Popular Bowser		4.45 Evaw Blk 3			300 y

**Trial 5 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.98 Distance: 5.5, 11**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	16	1 Air Tyrur		4.56 Slaw Rnon			750 y
	17	3 Ballinacrow Girl		4.37 Faw Finwl			750 y
	19	5 Sassy Sue		4.41 Rnon Crd 1/2			200 y

**Trial 6 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.84 Distance: 3, 19**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	20	2 Highwaytoheaven		4.41 Faw ald			2100 y
	21	4 Foulscourt Yank		4.44 Crd 1/2 finwl			1100 y
	22	6 Popular Towser		4.71 slaw nvsh			300 Y

**Trial 7 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.85 Distance: 2,3**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
	23	1 Random Woodie		4.5 Rnon Fcdck 4			1500 y
	24	3 Ardrahan Trump		4.42 Faw ald	1500		750 n
	25	5 House of Magic		4.6 Slaw Rnon			800 y

**Trial 8 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.60 Distance: 12, 0.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
-----	------	------	-------	---------	---------	-----	------

26	2	Running Sky	4.47	Evaw Rnon	600	y
27	6	Brother Jim	4.31	Qaw ald	3800	y
29	4	Breezing Honey	4.32	<b>Faw Rnon</b>		<b>w/d</b>

**Trial 9 Result:1-3-5 Time: 29.80 Distance: 5, 6.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
30		1 Monroe Bruce	4.39	Faw ald		2200	y
31		5 Cash for Aussie	4.53	Slaw Rnon		700	y
32		3 Artistic Way	4.5	Evaw Rnon		No sale	n

**Trial 10 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 30.01 Distance: 2.5, 11.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
33		2 Bawnogue Tully	4.46	Bmp 1 Fcdck 3		400	y
34		4 Abrakebabra Kizz	4.49	Bmp 1 finwl		no sale	n
35		6 Dream Sun	4.39	Faw ald		800	y

**Trial 11 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 30.37 Distance: 4.5, 0.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
36		1 Peachstreet Hero	4.34	faw Ck 3		500	Y
37		3 Artistic Prince	4.47	Evaw finwl	1500	1000	n
39		5 Doyougetme	4.65	Slaw Rnon	400	250	n

**Trial 12 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.79 Distance: 7.5, 3.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
40		2 Monroe Jet	4.39	Faw ald		1750	y
41		4 Peachstreet Jack	4.42	Faw Blk 3		350	y
42		6 Cash for Robbo	4.61	slaw Blk 3		650	y

**Trial 13 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.53 Distance: 2,2**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
43		5 Brownhill Shep	4.49	Evaw Finwl		600	y
44		1 Random Product	4.45	Ald Clr	4000	1800	n
45		3 Kilcash Lil	4.59	Crdrup Rnon		750	y

**Trial 14 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.61 Distance: 3/4, 1**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
47		2 Cushie Be Fast	4.41	Faw Finwl		1200	y
48		6 Knockren	4.4	Finwl Ldnrl	2000	1100	n
49		4 Monroe Act	4.29	Qaw Hdnrl		2500	y

**Trial 15: Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.87 Distance: 1.5, 2.5**

Lot	Trap	Name	Split	Remarks	Reserve	Bid	Sold
50		1 Abrakebabra ivy	4.42	Evaw Finwl	1200	600	n
52		5 Believe In Blue	4.53	Slaw Finwl		800	y
53		3 Wicked Tuna	4.37	Ldbs Hdnrl	0	800	y

**Trial 16: Result: 2-4-6 Time: 30.09 Distance: 7.5, 3**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
54		2 Noirs County		4.41 Faw ald	1000	500	n
55		4 shaneboy Bling		4.44 Evaw Bmp 3		250	y
56		6 Beslow Maudie		4.45 Evaw Blk 4		150	y

**Trial 17: Result:1-3-5 Time: 29.68 Distance: 1,7**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
57		1 Abrakebabra Soda		4.34 Faw ald	2000	700	n
58		3 Rallying Rebel		4.47 Ck 1 Finwl	3000	900	n
59		5 Beslow Nioko		4.38 Faw Rnon		250	y

**Trial 18 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.42 Distance: 14, 12.75**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
61		2 Dear Alsation		4.37 Faw ald	2500	1000	n
62		6 Beslow Icky Ocky		4.4 Blkru Ck 3		no bid	n
64		4 Drumcrow Lexi		4.46 Evaw Nvsh		no bid	n

**Trial 19 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.76 Distance: nk, 11.5**

<b>Lot</b>	<b>Trap</b>	<b>Name</b>	<b>Split</b>	<b>Remarks</b>	<b>Reserve</b>	<b>Bid</b>	<b>Sold</b>
65		1 Lemon George		4.31 Faw ald			w/d
68		3 Weigh In Tyche		4.36 Faw finwl		650	y
69		5 Beslow Joes Bar		4.44 Evaw Rnon		150	y

**Trial 20 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.80 Distance: 3.5**

70		4 Laurens Pandora		4.37 Faw stywl		500	y
73		2 Kansil Sky		4.43 Evaw Rnon		350	y

**Trial 21 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 17.18 Distance: 2, 4.5**

28		1 Peachstreet Lady		Evaw Rnon		150	y
66		3 Ladam		Faw ald		no bid	n
72		5 Beslow Jessica		Msdbk Rnon		no bid	n